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To the red three 
2008, acrylic, artist pen, varnish on linen, cm. 100x 

Adam Glinsi 
LIECHTENSTE 

Born 1943 in Poland, later he 
became an Austrian citizen. 
Since 1980 he is living with 
his wife in Liechtenstein. He 
studied theology, philosophy 
and the science of education 
in Poland and Austria (final 
examinations in Innsbruck: 
masters degree of theology). 

He worked in Poland, Austria, 
Liechtenstein as a teacher of 
religion and is now in retire-
ment. Adam Glinski is painting 
and writing since his youth. 
His pictures are often reflected 
by short texts (word-pictures). 
His works were presented in 

the last years in Liechtenstein 
(Triesen), Germany (Man-

nheim, Baden-Baden), Aus-
tria (Graz, Salzburg), France 
(Strasbourg, Colmar). With his 
literary texts he participates in 
different competitions in Ger-
many and Austria since 2008. 
His painting is moving be-
tween abstract and figurative 

and gives rooms for different 
interpretations of contents 
and intentions. In his painting 
and writing he is looking for 
the deeper sense. 

21 


